
Cloud Adoption Services

Instructor Led 

Training

• Enterprise Business 

Intelligence that is proven, 
practical and reliable

• Create the real-time reports 
and dashboards you want 
with JD Edwards data

• Built-in JD Edwards 
intelligence in a best-of-
breed reporting software

• The data you need with 
unparalleled cost of 
ownership and lasting 
value 

On-site and live virtual 
custom courses designed for 
your audience with your 
data and course materials 
including student manuals 

and exercises, taught with 
real life application scenarios 
and optional advanced 
sessions and lab days.

info@iLearnERP.com

www.iLearnERP.com/das-university/

303-653-9210

10 Hours of 

Monthly Live 

Webinar Training

150  Short Video 

Tutorials

Robust Resources 

Including QRC’s, 

Student Manuals 

and Hands-on 

Practice Exercises

Recorded 

Webinars that 

Cover Unique 

Advanced Topics

One-on-one, 

Ask-A-Trainer 

Training Support

DAS 

University
ReportsNow

Hosted in our 

Cloud Learning 

Management 

Solution

Report Writing 
Services

Utilize our experts to help you 
get the most out of 
ReportsNow DAS, whether it’s 
assistance for one report, a 
backlog of requests, or full 
project support from scope to 
delivery, our resources can 
help and empower your team 
with one-on-one assistance!

Contact Us for a 

Personalized Demo of 

ReportsNow

Flexible 

Subscription 

Options
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